ARKANSAS REGISTER

Transmittal Sheet
Use only for FINAL and EMERGENCY RULES

‘Secretary of State

Mark Martin

500 Woodlane, Suite 026
Little Rock, Arkansas 72201-1094

(501) 682-5070
www.sos.arkansas.gov

For Office

Use Only:
Effective Date —_Code Number

Name of Agency Arkansas Department of Labor

Department Board of Electrical Examiners

Contact Denise P. Oxley E-maj] 9enise.oxley@arkansas.gov py, ... (501) 682-4502

Statutory Authority for Promulgating Rules Ark. Code Ann. 20-31-104 ‘

Rule Title: Rule 010.13-008. The National Electrical Code

Intended Effective Date - Date

(Check One) ’
[] Emergency (ACA 25-15-204) - Legal Notice Published.............oiviiivi e 71211 17'7"29/201 !
[] 10 Days After Filing (ACA 25-15-204)  Final Date for Public COMMERt +...vv..vvviserones.) 9/19/2017
Other January 1, 2018 Reviewed by Legislative Council ..................... 12/12/2017

[Must be more than 10 days after filing date.) j
Adopted by State ABEntY . ...vvvviiiiiiiir i 9/19/2017
Electronic Copy of Rule e-mailed from: (Required under ACA 25-15-218)

Denise P. Oxley denise.oxley@arkansas.gov December 14, 2014
CDntagt Person E-mail Address Date
CERTIFICATION OF AUTHORIZED OFFICER
I Hereby Certify That The Attached Rules Were Adopted
In Compliance with the Arkansas Administrative Act. (ACA 25-15-201 et. seq:): T

f £ o o =7

S —

[N =

4 Signature [

501-682-4541 leon.jones@arkansas.gov :{:

Phone Nuwmber E-mail Address
Director of Labor, State of Arkansas
Titie

December 14, 2017

5
A

Date

Revised 7/2015 to reflect new leglslation passed In the 2015 Regular Session (Act 1258}, Thls act changed the effective date from 30 days to 10 days after filing the rufe.



AGENCY #010.13
Attachment C
ADMINISTRATIVE REGULATIONS OF
THE BOARD OF ELECTRICAL EXAMINERS,
STATE OF ARKANSAS

010.13 Administrative Regulations of the Board of Electrical Examiners of the State of
Arkansas

Amendment 1. Amend Rule 010.13-008 (A) and (B), dealing with the National Electrical Code,
to read as follows:

010.13-008 The National Electrical Code

A, The Board hereby adopts and incorporates herein the National Electrical Code, 2017
edition of the National Fire Protection Association.

B. The National Electrical Code, 2017, shall be the standard. for the construction,

installation, repair, and maintenance of electrical facilities and the performance of ¢lectrical
work. '

1, Nothwithstanding the provisions of the 2017 National Electrical Code, arc fault
circuit interrupters shall not be required in kitchens and laundry rooms.

Amendment 2. Amend Rule 010.13-023 to read as follows:

- 010.13-023 Effective Date, Repealer and History.

A.  Effective June 1, 2008 all previous regulations promulgated by the Board are hereby
repealed.

B. The effective date of these regulations is June 1, 2008,

C. History

1. The Board of Elecirical Examiners first promulgated regu_}iati,&_ :
September 12, 1979. These regulations were amended effective October 135, 1987



3. All previous rules and regulations of the Board were repealed and new rules and
regulations were adopted effective September 1, 1999. These regulations were amended

effective August 20, 2001; January 1, 2002; April 1, 2002; April 1, 2004; November 1, 2004;
October 1, 2005; and June 1, 2006.

4. Al previous rules and regulations of the Board of Electrical Examiners were
repealed and new rules and regulations were adopted effective June 1, 2008. [Note: Rule
010.13-019 was amended effective September 1, 2008 by adding subsectlon (B)].

5. Regulations 010.13-009, 010.13-011, and 010.13-012 pertaining to Specialist
Sign Electricians and examination fees were amended by emergency regulation effective July 31,
2009. These changes were adopted as permanent regulations effective February 1, 2010.
Regulation 010.13-012(H)(5) was also added by the permanent regulation,

6. Effective September 15, 2011 the following Rules were amended: Rule 010.13-
008(B)(to update the National Electrical Code to the 2011 edition).

7. Regulation 010.13-021 pertaining to the licensure of electrical inspectors, was
adopted with an effective date of February 10, 2014,

8. Dffective November 21, 2014, Rule 010.13-008 was amended to update the
National Electrical Code to the 2014 edition, with certain exceptions (dealing with arc fault
circuit interrupters in kitchen and laundry rooms).

0. Effective January 1, 2016, the following Rules were amended: Rule 010.13-002
~ (Information for public guidance); Rule 010.13-004 (Rule~-making); Rule 010.13-005
(Emergency rule-making); Rule 010.13-009 (Definitions); and Rule 010.13-013 (Llcenses) A

new rule was adopted effective January 1, 2016, Rule 010.13-022 (Active duty semce members,
returning military veterans, and spouses).

10. Effective June 1, 2017, Rule 010.13-008 was amended to adopt Article 691, Large-

Scale Photovoltaic (PV) Power Production Fagility, 2017 edition of the National Electrical Code as
an emergency rule.

I1.  Effective January 1, 2018, Rule 010.13-008 was amended to update to the 2017
edition of the National Electrical Code, with certain exceptions (dealing with arc fauit circuit
interrupters in kitchen and laundry rooms).



